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COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE – MAY 5, 2003 
 

AWARD OF TENDER T03-035 
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS PICKUP TRUCKS 

 
Recommendation 

 
The Commissioner of Community Services, in consultation with the Executive Director of 
Buildings, Facilities and Parks, the Director of Purchasing, and the Director of Reserves 
and Investments recommends: 

 
1. That Part  “A” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of two (2) ½ ton 4x2 

pickup trucks, be awarded to Northtown Ford Sales Ltd. for a total price of 
$50,105.50. Projects 4988-0-03 / 4887-0-03; and,  

 
2. That Part “B” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of two (2) compact size 

4x4 pickup trucks, be awarded to Addison on Dundas Ltd. for a total cost of 
$51,890.30. Projects 5032-0-03 / 5031-0-03; and, 

 
3. That Part “C” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of two (2) midsize, 4x4 

pickup trucks, be awarded to Davidson Chrysler for a total cost of $57,343.60. 
Projects 4905-0-03 / 4906-0-03; and, 

 
4. That Part “D” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of three (3) ¾ ton HD 

crew cab 4x2 pickup trucks, be awarded to McAlpine Ford Lincoln sales for a total 
cost of $99,015.00. Projects 4879-0-03 / 4877-0-03 / 4989-0-03; and, 

 
5. That Part “E” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of three (3) compact size 

4x2 pickup trucks, to be awarded to Alex Irvine Motors Ltd. for a total cost of 
$65,139.45. Project 5039-0-03; and, 

 
6. That Part “F” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of one (1) ¾ ton cargo 

van, be awarded to MacIver Dodge Ltd. for a total cost of $25,675.05. Project 4883-
0-03; and, 

 
7. That Part “G” of Tender T03-035, for the supply and delivery of four (4) ¾ ton regular 

cab 4x4 pickup trucks with snow plows, to be awarded to McAlpine Ford Lincoln 
sales for a total cost of $145,176.00. Projects 4986-0-03 / 4990-0-03 / 5019-0-02.      

 
 Purpose 
 

To award tender T0-035 for the supply and delivery of various pickup trucks. 
  
  
Background – Analysis and Options 

 
Council approved funds to purchase various pickup trucks as part of the ongoing 
equipment program. These projects were approved in 2003, as part of the capital budget 
and are funded from the Vehicle Reserve Fund, Development Charges and Taxation.   
 
This tender was advertised in the Liberal and the Electronic Tendering Network (ETN), 
with twenty seven (27) bid documents issued and sixteen (16) received on closing date, 
March 27, 2003. In Part “A” one (1) bidder was noncompliant and one (1) bidder was 
noncompliant in all cases.  The result of the bids including GST and PST are as follows: 
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  Supplier              Bid 

 
Part A  
1.  Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    $50,105.50 

 2.  Bill Huston Ford Ltd.     $55,538.10 
 3.  Addison Dundas Ltd.     $56,099.30 
 4.  Davidson Chrysler      $56,455.80 
 5.  Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    $56,796.20 
 6.  Alex Irvine Motors Limited    $56,902.00 
 7.  Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   $57,771.40 
 8.  Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $57,467.80 
 9.  MacIver Dodge Limited    $58,374.00 
 10. West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   $58,394.70 
 11. Unionville Motors Ltd.    $59,008.80 
 12. Dixie Ford Sales Limited    $59,530.90 
 13. Woodland Chevrolet Oldsmobile   $60,618.22 
 14. Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    $61,709.81 
 15. McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales    Non-Compliant 
 16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 
   
 PART B 

1.  Addison on Dundas Ltd.    $51,890.30 
 2.  Alex Irvine Motors Limited    $53,764.80 
 3.  Woodland Chevrolet Oldsmobile   $55,968.04 
 4.  McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales    $56,350.00 
 5.  Unionville Motors Ltd.    $56,421.30 
 6.  Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    $56,504.10 
 7.  Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    $57,265.40 
 8.  Bill Houston Ford Ltd.    $57,598.90 
 9.  Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    $59,761.71 
 10. Dixie Ford Sales Limited     $61,299.60 
 11. Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $61,439.90 
 12. Davidson Chrysler     No Bid 
 13. MacIver Dodge Limited    No Bid 
 14. West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   No Bid 
 15. Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   No Bid 
 16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 
 
 PART C 
 1.  Davidson Chrysler     $57,343.60 
 2.  MacIver Dodge Limited    $58,707.50 
 3.  West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   $59,282.50 
 4.  Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   $59,530.90 
 5.  Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $61,439.90 
 6.  Unionville Motors Ltd.    No Bid 
 7.  Bill Houston Ford Ltd.    No Bid 
 8.  Woodland Chevrolet Oldsmobile   No Bid 
 9.  Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    No Bid 

10. Dixie Ford Sales Limited    No Bid 
11. Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    No Bid 
12. Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    No Bid 
13. Addison on Dundas Ltd.    No Bid 
14. Alex Irvine Motors      No Bid 
15. McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales    No Bid 
16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 
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PART D 

 1.  McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales   $99,015.00 
 2.  Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    $101,078.10 
 3.  Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    $101,526.60 
 4.  Davidson Chrysler      $102,982.50 
 5.  Alex Irvine Motors Limited    $103,148.10 
 6.  Bill Houston Ford Ltd.    $103,500.00 
 7.  MacIver Dodge Limited    $103,548.30 
 8.  Addison on Dundas Ltd.    $104,466.00 
 9.  Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $105,100.80 
 10. West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   $105,556.20 
 11. Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   $105,752.85 
 12. Unionville Motors Ltd.    $107,702.10 
 13. Dixie Ford Sales Limited    $107,815.78 
 14. Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    $110,694.45 
 15. Woodlands Chevrolet Oldsmobile   $111,417.92 
 16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 
 
 PART E 
 1.  Alex Irvine Motors Limited    $65,139.45 
 2.  Addison on Dundas Ltd.    $66,550.50 
 3.  McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales    $67,447.50 
 4.  Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    $68,596.35 
 5.  Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    $68,789.55 
 6.  Woodlands Chevrolet Oldsmobile   $70,811.01 
 7.  Bill Houston Ford Ltd.    $72,439.65 
 8.  Dixie Ford Sales Limited    $74,940.90 
 9.  Unionville Motors Ltd.    $75,003.00 
 10. Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    $75,083.55 
 11. Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $86,436.30 
 12. Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   No Bid 
 13. West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   No Bid 
 14. MacIver Dodge Limited    No Bid 
 15. Davidson Chrysler     No Bid 
 16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 
 
 PART F 
 1.  MacIver Dodge Limited    $25,676.05 
 2.  Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $26,404.00 
. 3.  McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales    $26,737.50 
 4.  Bill Houston Ford Ltd     $26,751.30 
 5.  Davidson Chrysler     $27,079.05 
 6.  Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    $27,297.55 
 7.  Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    $27,364.25 
 8.  Addison on Dundas Ltd.    $27,641.40 
 9.  Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   $27,959.95 
 10. West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   $28,230.20 
 11. Alex Irvine Motors Limited    $29,009.90 
 12. Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    $29,349.15 
 13. Woodlands Chevrolet Oldsmobile   $30,579.61 
 14. Dixie Ford Sales Limited    $30,830.35 
 15. Unionville Motors Ltd.    $32,658.85 
 16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 
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  PART G 
 1.  McAlpine Ford Lincoln Sales   $145,176.00 
 2.  Bill Houston Ford Ltd     $149,454.00 
 3.  Bramview Ford Sales Ltd.    $153,704.40 

4. Northtown Ford Sales Ltd.    $154,077.00 
5.  Alex Irvine Motors Limited    $154,670.40 
6.  Addison on Dundas Ltd.    $158,726.60 
7.  Pine Tree Ford Lincoln    $160,597.13 
8.  Davidson Chrysler     $161,759.00 
9.  Dixie Ford Sales Limited    $162,191.17 
10. Unionville Motors Ltd.    $163,801.40 
11. MacIver Dodge Limited    $164,353.40 
12. Seven View Chrysler Ltd.    $164,482.20 
13. Woodlands Chevrolet Oldsmobile   $164,563.29 
14. Milton Chrysler Dodge Limited   $165,296.40 
15. West End Chrysler Dodge Ltd.   $165,319.40 
16. Summit Ford Sales     Non-Compliant 

     
Conclusion 
 
Staff have reviewed the submissions and based on the tender results, and the ability of 
the manufacturers to supply the required equipment, it is recommended that the tender 
be awarded to the various bidders as noted in the recommendations. There are sufficient 
funds available in the approved Capital Budget to complete these projects. 
 
Attachments 
None 
 
Report Prepared by: 

 Alvin Boyce, Fleet Maintenance Supervisor, ext. 6141. 
 
 Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
 
 G. Doris Haas 
 Commissioner of Community Services 
            
  
 


